

Present: Chair Jim Foley, Supervisors Bob Koch, Craig Robson, JoAnn Wingers and Henry St. Maurice

Also in Attendance: Chair Vern Gove, Supervisor Tom Borgkvist, Chris Hardy, Traci Horn, Shonna Neary, Susan Fisher, William Hellenbrand, Jeff Smith (Burke Truck & Equipment), Dan Mueller (Northeast Asphalt, Inc.), Matt Shappell (School District of Poynette), and Martin Shanks (Village of Poynette)

Chair Foley called the meeting to order at 8:30 a.m. The meeting was properly noticed and published.

Approval of Agenda

Motion by Koch, second by Wingers, to approve the agenda. Motion carried.

Approval of Minutes

Motion by Koch, second by St. Maurice, to approve the February 6, 2020 Highway Committee minutes. Motion carried.

Approval of Vouchers

The committee reviewed the voucher report detailing payments made from December 31, 2019 through February 26, 2020. Horn provided input regarding some of the expenses.

Motion by Wingers, second by Koch, to approve the vouchers for a total of \$461,908.92. Motion carried.

Bid Opening

Bids for the design-build sand mix portable fabric building, video security upgrades, single axle truck double wing accessory equipment, single axle truck single wing accessory equipment, and tandem axle truck single wing accessory equipment were opened and read aloud by Hardy. Bids will be tabulated and posted on DemandStar. Awards will be determined at the April 2, 2020 Highway Committee meeting.

Award Bids – Asphalt Materials County Hwy N in Town of Hampden

A review of the costs was presented for each bid. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder meeting all project specifications, Tri-County Paving, Inc.

Bidder	3 LT 58-28 S	4 LT 58-28 S
Tri-County Paving, Inc. *AWARDED	\$42.10/Ton	\$46.10/Ton
Wolf Paving & Excavating of Madison, Inc.	\$42.50/Ton	\$45.50/Ton
D.L. Gasser Construction	\$47.52/Ton	\$49.76/Ton
Northeast Asphalt, Inc.	\$40.60/Ton	\$44.40/Ton

Motion by Koch, second by St. Maurice, to award the asphalt materials County Hwy N bid to Tri-County Paving, Inc. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Asphalt Materials County Hwy GG in Town of Wycena

A review of the costs was presented for each bid. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder meeting all project specifications, Tri-County Paving, Inc.

Bidder	3 LT 58-28 S	4 LT 58-28 S
Tri-County Paving, Inc. *AWARDED	\$42.10/Ton	\$46.10/Ton
Wolf Paving & Excavating of Madison, Inc.	\$42.50/Ton	\$45.50/Ton
D.L. Gasser Construction	\$47.52/Ton	\$49.76/Ton
Northeast Asphalt, Inc.	\$40.60/Ton	\$44.40/Ton

Motion by Koch, second by Wingers, to award the asphalt materials County Hwy GG bid to Tri-County Paving, Inc. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Asphalt Materials County Hwy E in Town of Marcellon

A review of costs was presented for each bid. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder, Northeast Asphalt, Inc.

Bidder	3 LT 58-28 S	4 LT 58-28 S
Northeast Asphalt, Inc. *AWARDED	\$40.60/Ton	\$44.40/Ton
Tri-County Paving, Inc.	\$42.10/Ton	\$46.10/Ton
Wolf Paving & Excavating of Madison, Inc.	\$42.50/Ton	\$45.50/Ton
D.L. Gasser Construction	\$47.52/Ton	\$49.76/Ton

Motion by Robson, second by St. Maurice, to award the asphalt materials County Hwy E bid to Northeast Asphalt, Inc. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Sealcoat Oil HFRS-2

A review of costs was presented for each bid. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder, Henry G. Meigs, LLC.

Bidder	HFRS-2 FOB jobsite	HFRS-2 applied
Henry G. Meigs, LLC. *AWARDED	\$1.7177/Gallon	\$2.0177/Gallon
Flint Hills Resources	\$1.983/Gallon	No Bid

Motion made by Wingers, second by Koch, to award the 2020 sealcoat oil HFRS-2 bid to Henry G. Meigs, LLC. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Sealcoat Oil HFRS-2P

A review of costs was presented for each bid. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder, Henry G. Meigs, LLC.

Bidder	HFRS-2P FOB jobsite	HFRS-2P applied
Henry G. Meigs, LLC. *AWARDED	\$1.8602/Gallon	\$2.1602/Gallon
Fahrner Asphalt Sealers, LLC.	No Bid	\$0.40/Gallon
Flint Hills Resources	\$2.234/Gallon	No Bid

Columbia County Highway Committee

Minutes

March 5, 2020

Motion made by Wingers, second by Robson, to award the 2020 sealcoat oil HFRS-2P bid to Henry G. Meigs, LLC. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Tackcoat Oil

A review of costs was presented for each bid. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder, Henry G. Meigs, LLC.

Bidder	CSS-1H (diluted)	CRS 2-SE (diluted)
Henry G. Meigs, LLC. *AWARDED	\$1.60/Gallon	\$1.975 *Price is for NonDiluted
Flint Hills Resources	\$2.06/Gallon	No Bid

Motion made by Koch, second by Robson, to award the 2020 tackcoat oil bid to Henry G. Meigs, LLC. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Patch Materials

A review of costs was presented for each bid. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder for cold patch D.L. Gasser Construction and the lowest bidder for high performance patch Blackstone Technologies, LLC.

Bidder	Cold Patch FOB plant	High Performance FOB plant
Blackstone Technologies, LLC. *AWARDED ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS, SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY	No Bid	\$106.50/Ton
D.L. Gasser Construction *AWARDED ON AS NEEDED BASIS, SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY	\$62.50/Ton	No Bid
Wolf Paving & Excavating of Madison, Inc.	\$100.00/Ton	\$110.00/Ton

Motion made by Koch, second by Wingers, to award the 2020 cold patch bid to D.L. Gasser Construction. Motion carried.

Motion made by Koch, second by St. Maurice, to award the high performance patch bid to Blackstone Technologies, LLC. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Small Diameter (18” - 36”) Riveted Corrugated Metal Pipe, Endwalls, & Bands

A review of the small diameter riveted corrugated metal pipe, endwalls, and bands cost was presented. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder, Contech.

Small Diameter Riveted Corrugated Metal Pipe, Endwalls, and Bands

Bidder	Diameter	Gauge	Cost per Ft.	Cost per Endwall	Cost per 10C Band
Contech *AWARDED	18"	16	\$12.90	\$61.60	\$25.80
Metal Culverts, Inc.	18"	16	\$13.03	\$71.90	\$26.06
Contech *AWARDED	24"	16	\$16.34	\$93.00	\$32.50
Metal Culverts, Inc.	24"	16	17.44	\$107.25	\$34.88
Contech *AWARDED	30"	14	\$25.80	\$170.00	\$51.00
Metal Culverts, Inc.	30"	14	26.68	\$183.70	\$53.36
Contech *AWARDED	36"	14	\$30.96	\$275.00	\$62.00
Metal Culverts, Inc.	36"	14	\$31.82	\$295.65	\$63.64

Motion by Wingers, second by Robson, to award the bid for small diameter riveted corrugated metal pipe, endwalls, and bands to Contech. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Large Diameter (42” – 72”) Riveted Corrugated Metal Pipe, Endwalls, & Bands

A review of the large diameter riveted corrugated metal pipe, endwalls, and bands cost was presented. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder, Metal Culverts, Inc.

Large Diameter Riveted Corrugated Metal Pipe, Endwalls, and Bands

Bidder	Diameter	Gauge	Cost per Ft.	Cost per Endwall	Cost per 10C Band
Contech	42"	12	\$57.00	\$740.00	\$114.00
Metal Culverts, Inc. *AWARDED	42"	12	\$51.74	\$690.80	\$103.48
Contech	48"	12	\$64.60	\$850.00	\$129.00
Metal Culverts, Inc. *AWARDED	48"	12	\$58.94	\$789.00	\$117.88
Contech	54"	12	\$74.10	\$1,000.00	\$148.00
Metal Culverts, Inc. *AWARDED	54"	12	\$67.20	\$970.45	\$134.40
Contech	60"	10	\$110.00	\$1,465.00	\$220.00
Metal Culverts, Inc. *AWARDED	60"	10	\$93.58	\$1,455.65	\$187.16
Contech	72"	10	\$129.00	\$1,745.00	\$258.00
Metal Culverts, Inc. *AWARDED	72"	10	\$111.72	\$1,734.70	\$223.44

Motion by Robson, second by Koch, to award the large diameter riveted corrugated metal pipe, endwalls, and bands bid to Metal Culverts, Inc. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Metal Arch Pipe, Endwalls & Bands

A review of metal arch pipe, endwalls, and bands was presented for small and large diameters. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder, Contech for the small diameter items and the lowest bidder, Metal Culverts, Inc. for the large diameter items.

Columbia County Highway Committee

Minutes

March 5, 2020

Bidder	Arch Size - Inches	Gauge	Cost per Ft.	Cost per Endwall	Cost per 10C Band
Contech *AWARDED	21x15	16	\$13.65	\$66.00	\$13.65
Metal Culverts, Inc.	21x15	16	\$13.82	\$61.85	\$27.64
Contech *AWARDED	24x18	16	\$17.00	\$95.00	\$34.00
Metal Culverts, Inc.	24x18	16	\$16.07	\$75.25	\$32.14
Contech *AWARDED	28x20	16	\$18.00	\$117.00	\$36.00
Metal Culverts, Inc.	28x20	16	\$18.62	\$88.60	\$36.24
Contech *AWARDED	28x20	14	\$22.66	\$117.00	\$45.00
Metal Culverts, Inc.	28x20	14	\$22.89	\$88.60	\$45.78
Contech *AWARDED	35x24	14	\$27.55	\$170.00	\$55.00
Metal Culverts, Inc.	35x24	14	\$27.84	\$165.40	\$55.68
Contech *AWARDED	42x29	14	\$34.00	\$260.00	\$68.00
Metal Culverts, Inc.	42x29	14	\$33.17	\$245.10	\$66.34
Contech	49x33	12	\$67.00	\$460.00	\$135.00
Metal Culverts, Inc. *AWARDED	49x33	12	\$53.28	\$441.50	\$106.56
Contech	57x38	12	\$69.00	\$679.00	\$140.00
Metal Culverts, Inc. *AWARDED	57x38	12	\$60.58	\$630.90	\$121.16
Contech	64x43	12	\$76.00	\$940.00	\$155.00
Metal Culverts, Inc. *AWARDED	64x43	12	\$69.02	\$877.00	\$138.04
Contech	71x47	10	\$112.00	\$1,235.00	\$224.00
Metal Culverts, Inc. *AWARDED	71x47	10	\$95.57	\$1,146.30	\$191.14
Contech	83x57	10	\$132.00	\$1,778.00	\$264.00
Metal Culverts, Inc. *AWARDED	83x57	10	\$114.68	\$1,649.75	\$229.36

Motion by Robson, second by Wingers, to award the small diameter metal arch pipe, endwalls, and bands bid to Contech and the large diameter metal arch pipe, endwalls, and bands to Metal Culverts, Inc. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Crushed Stone County Hwy E

Hardy presented a description of the project and the use of crushed stone materials in ¾” and 1¼” sizes. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder, The Kraemer Company.

Bidder	¾"	1 ¼"	Quarry
The Kraemer Company *AWARDED	\$5.20/Ton	\$5.20/Ton	Jenkins
Yahara	\$5.65/Ton	\$5.65/Ton	Stiemke
Green Dream International	\$6.30/Ton	\$6.30/Ton	-
Tri-County Paving, Inc.	\$6.80/Ton	\$6.80/Ton	Hahn

Motion by Koch, second by Wingers, to award the crushed stone bid for County Hwy E to The Kraemer Company. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Crushed Stone County Hwy N

Hardy presented a description of the project and the use of crushed stone materials in ¾” and 1¼” sizes. The Department recommended accepting the crushed stone bid for County Hwy N from Yahara Materials.

Bidder	¾"	1 1/4"	Quarry
Yahara Materials *AWARDED	\$5.65/Ton	\$5.65/Ton	Stiemke
Linck Aggregates, Inc.	\$5.65/Ton	\$5.65/Ton	Westphal
Green Dream International	\$6.30/Ton	\$6.30/Ton	-
The Kraemer Company	\$5.95/Ton	\$5.95/Ton	Stevenson
Tri-County Paving, Inc.	\$6.80/Ton	\$6.80/Ton	Hahn

Motion by Wingers, second by Robson, to award the crushed stone bid for County Hwy N to Yahara Materials. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Crushed Stone County Hwy GG

Hardy presented a description of the project and the use of ¾” crushed stone. The Department recommended accepting the crushed stone bid for County Hwy GG from Yahara Materials.

Bidder	¾"	Quarry
Yahara Materials *AWARDED	\$5.65/Ton	Stiemke
Green Dream International	\$6.30/Ton	-
The Kraemer Company	\$5.55/Ton	Jenkins
Tri-County Paving, Inc.	\$6.80/Ton	Hahn

Motion by Robson, second by St. Maurice, to award the crushed stone bid for County Hwy GG to Yahara Materials. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Crushed Stone County Hwy A

Hardy presented a project explanation noting that the County can recycle their blacktop and use it on County Highway A saving approximately \$34,000. The Department recommended reducing the amount of 1 ¼” material by approximately 10,000 tons. The Department also recommended accepting the ¾” material bid and the reduced amount of 1 ¼” material bid from Linck Aggregates, Inc.

Bidder	¾"	1 1/4"	Quarry
Linck Aggregates, Inc. *AWARDED	\$5.65/Ton	\$5.65/Ton	Westphal
The Kraemer Company	\$5.55/Ton	\$5.55/Ton	Jenkins
Yahara Materials	\$5.65/Ton	\$5.65/Ton	Stiemke
Green Dream International	\$6.30/Ton	\$6.30/Ton	-
Tri-County Paving, Inc.	\$6.80/Ton	\$6.80/Ton	Hahn

Motion by St. Maurice, second by Robson, to award the ¾” crushed stone bid and the reduced quantity 1¼” crushed stone bid to Linck Aggregates, Inc. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Recycled Asphalt

Use of recycled asphalt on the County Highway A was discussed. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder, Tri-County Paving, Inc. and rejecting all bids for the sale of uncrushed recycled asphalt.

Bidder	Crushing Recycled Blacktop
Tri-County Paving, Inc. *AWARDED	\$4.00/Ton
The Kraemer Company	\$4.45/Ton
Yahara Materials, Inc.	\$5.30/Ton

Motion by St. Maurice, second by Robson, to award the crushing recycled asphalt bid to Tri-County Paving, Inc. and reject all bids for the sale of uncrushed recycled asphalt. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Road Pulverization

A summary of the road pulverization bids for CTH A, CTH E, CTH N, and CTH GG was presented. The Department recommended accepting the lowest bidder, Kartechner Brothers for CTH A. The Department further recommended accepting the lowest bidder, Northeast Asphalt, Inc. for CTH E, CTH N, and CTH GG.

Bidder	Bid #1 CTH A	Bid #2 CTH E	Bid #3 CTH N	Bid #4 CTH GG
Kartechner Brothers *AWARDED	\$0.740/Sq. Yd.	\$0.860/Sq. Yd.	\$1.220/Sq. Yd.	\$1.550/Sq. Yd.
Northeast Asphalt, Inc. *AWARDED	\$0.750/Sq. Yd.	\$0.790/Sq. Yd.	\$0.950/Sq. Yd.	\$1.300/Sq. Yd.
The Kraemer Company	\$0.941/Sq. Yd.	\$1.124/Sq. Yd.	\$1.166/Sq. Yd.	\$2.532/Sq. Yd.
Tri-County Paving, Inc.	\$0.795/Sq. Yd.	\$0.845/Sq. Yd.	\$1.250/Sq. Yd.	\$2.000/Sq. Yd.
WK Construction Company, Inc.	\$1.110/Sq. Yd.	\$1.140/Sq. Yd.	\$2.130/Sq. Yd.	\$4.880/Sq. Yd.

Motion by Koch, second by Wingers, to award the CTH A road pulverization bid to Kartechner Brothers and to award CTH E, CTH N, and CTH GG road pulverization bids to Northeast Asphalt, Inc. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Single Axle Truck Chassis

The Department recommended accepting the lowest qualifying bid submitted by Quality Truck Care Center.

Bidder	Year	Make	Model	Bid
Quality Truck Care Center *AWARDED	2021	Western Star	4700SF	\$114,648.00/Unit
I-State Truck Center	2021	Western Star	4700	\$117,097.00/Unit
Kriete *Did not meet specs	2021	Mack	Granite	\$112,789.00/Unit
Lakeside International *Did not meet specs	2021	International	HO513	\$112,886.32/Unit

Motion by Koch, second by Wingers, to award the Single Axle Truck Chassis bid to Quality Truck Care Center. Motion carried.

Award Bids – Tandem Axle Truck Chassis

The Department recommended accepting the lowest qualifying bid submitted by I-State Truck Center.

Bidder	Year	Make	Model	Bid
I-State Truck Center *AWARDED	2021	Western Star	4700SF	\$118,959.00/Unit
Lakeside International *Did not meet specs	2021	International	HU513	\$119,869.60/Unit
Quality Truck Care Center	2021	Western Star	4700SF	\$121,195.00/Unit

Motion by Koch, second by Wingers, to award the Tandem Axle Truck Chassis bid to I-State Truck Center. Motion carried.

Capital Improvement Plan

Hardy presented the 2020 Capital Improvement Plan.

Spring 2020 Auction List

Hardy presented the items to be auctioned on Wisconsin Surplus.

Motion made by Koch, second by St. Maurice, to approve the items to be auctioned on Wisconsin Surplus the Spring of 2020. Motion carried.

Transfer 2003 PCMS Board #01-1018 from WisDOT to County

The State of Wisconsin has taken a message board out of service that has been used and maintained by Columbia County. The State of Wisconsin offered to transfer the item to Columbia County at no cost.

Motion made by Wingers, second by Robson, to accept the message board. Motion carried.

Lakeside Plastics donation of 120 cone bases

Hardy explained the use of 42" cones on the State Highway system which were purchased from Lakeside Plastics, Inc. The bases did not fit properly so Lakeside Plastics, Inc. wishes to donate 120 new cone bases at a total value of \$1,963.54 for use with the 42" cones.

Motion made by Koch, second by St. Maurice, to accept the donation of 120 cone bases from Lakeside Plastics, Inc. Motion carried.

State System Projects

State Highway projects were presented and planned detour routes were discussed.

County STIP Projects

Hardy presented a summary of projects noting the completion of CTH V, CTH U, and Haynes Rd. Two options for CTH A bridge were presented.

WisDOT Multi Modal Grant for CTH J

Hardy presented a summary of the project and municipalities involved.

CTH CD Bridge Replacement

The CTH CD bridge condition, replacement options, and channel relocation were discussed. Hardy noted Jewell Associates Engineers, Inc. is obtaining DNR permits.

Add No Parking Signs along CTH G at the West Bush Road Intersection

Traffic Safety Committee findings and plan were presented. Intersection safety and public access to Lake George were discussed. A map showing the placement of No Parking signs was presented.

Motion made by Koch, second by St. Maurice, to add No Parking signs along CTH G at the West Bush Road intersection. Motion carried.

Town of Wyocena County Aid Advance Carry Over

Hardy presented the Town of Wyocena request to carry over their 2019 County Aid Advance.

Motion made by Wingers, second by Robson, to allow the carry over of the Town of Wyocena 2019 County Aid Advance. Motion carried.

Town of Springvale County Aid Advance Carry Over

Hardy presented the Town of Springvale request to carry over their 2019 County Aid Advance and change the project location from Jones Rd. to Sawyer Rd.

Motion made by St. Maurice, second by Robson, to allow the carry over of the Town of Springvale 2019 County Aid Advance and change the project location from Jones Rd. to Sawyer Rd. Motion carried.

Village of Poynette regarding CTH CS in the Village Limit

Memo of Understanding: Pathways along CTH CS

Village of Poynette representative gave background on the need for pedestrians to have safe access to parks. Hardy explained the pathway location is in the County right of way. A Memo of Understanding for the pathways along CTH CS was presented. Construction costs are the responsibility of the Village but plans have to go through the Highway Department for approval.

Motion made by Robson, second by Koch, to approve the Memo of Understanding for pathways along CTH CS. Motion carried.

Village of Poynette regarding CTH CS in the Village Limit

Modifications to CTH CS & North St. Intersection

Options for safe crossing were presented. Hardy explained the next step is to draft a Memo of Understanding.

Motion made by Robson, second by St. Maurice, to have the Commissioner draft a Memo of Understanding. Motion carried.

Intergovernmental Agreement with City of Columbus for Fireman's Park Grading

Location, scope of work, and cost were discussed. Hardy explained the project includes pipe removal, ditch work, and rip rap. The Highway Department assisted with the permit. The \$84,616 project estimate will be billed to the City.

Motion made by St. Maurice, second by Wingers, to approve the Intergovernmental Agreement with City of Columbus. Motion carried.

Resolution Designating April 20th-24th Work Zone Safety Awareness Week

Hardy presented the resolution designating April 20-24, 2020 as Work Zone Safety Awareness Week.

Motion made by Koch, second by Robson, to approve the resolution designating the week of April 20-24, 2020 as Work Zone Safety Awareness Week and forward to the County Board. Motion carried.

Vacant Position Update & Position Replacement

Hardy presented position replacement requests for Patrol Supervisor, Master Mechanic, Highway Maintenance Worker, and Patrolman.

Motion made by Wingers, second by Robson, to approve the position replacement requests for Patrol Supervisor, Master Mechanic, Highway Maintenance Worker, and Patrolman. Motion carried.

Safety Items/Worker's Compensation Claims

One worker's compensation claim was reported and discussed.

Accounting Review

Neary explained 2019 is in the process of getting closed out. The 2019 financial report will be presented at the next meeting.

Highway Annual Report - 2019

Hardy presented the Highway Annual Report.

Motion by Koch, second by St. Maurice, to approve the 2019 Highway Annual Report. Motion carried.

Commissioner's Communications

Commissioner provided information about the Wisconsin Rail Plan. A traffic study at the intersection of CTH CS and CTH V was discussed.

Disallowance of Liability Claim: Charter, N2403 STH 188, Lodi, WI

Disallowance of Liability Claim: Fiess, US 51, Columbia County, WI

CLOSED SESSION

Motion made by Koch, second by Wingers, to go into closed session at 10:15 a.m. pursuant to Wisconsin State Statute Section 19.85(1)(g) "Conferring with legal counsel for the governmental body who is rendering oral or written advice concerning strategy to be adopted by the body with respect to litigation in which it is likely to become involved." [Disallowance of Liability Claim-Charter, N2403 STH 188, Lodi, WI] and [Disallowance of Liability Claim-Fiess, US 51, Columbia County, WI]. If the Committee goes into closed session, it will return to open session. The Committee may address such other matters that are authorized by law.

ROLL CALL VOTE: Ayes: 5, as follows: Robson, St. Maurice, Koch, Foley, and Wingers.

Noes: 0

Chair Gove, Supervisor Borgkvist, Hardy, Fisher, Neary and Horn were present in closed session.

OPEN SESSION

Columbia County Highway Committee

Minutes

March 5, 2020

Motion made by Koch, second by Robson, the Committee reconvened in open session at 10:20 a.m. Motion carried.

No action was taken in closed session.

Motion made by Koch, second by Wingers, to disallow the Charter N2403 STH 188, Lodi, WI liability claim and the Fiess, US 51, Columbia County, WI liability claim filed against the Highway Department. Motion carried.

Set Spring Municipal Meeting Date

Spring Municipal Meeting set for Wednesday, April 22, 2020 at 9:00 a.m.

Adjournment

The next regularly scheduled meeting will be Thursday, April 2, 2020 at 8:30 a.m.

Motion made by Koch, second by St. Maurice, to adjourn at 10:24 a.m. Motion carried.

Respectfully submitted:



JoAnn Wingers, Secretary



Traci Horn, Recording Secretary

cc: Highway Committee
County Board Chair Gove
County Board Vice Chair Drew
County Board 2nd Vice Chair Foley
Chris Hardy

Joseph Ruf, III
Susan Fisher
Internet
Susan M. Moll

